
4.8.

Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total
4.8.1. RSB 3,700 $9.00 $33,300.00 $9.42 $34,854.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.2. SR1 21,800 $11.50 $250,700.00 $9.93 $216,474.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.3. SR1.5 19,000 No Bid No Bid $9.93 $188,670.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.4. SR2.5 300 No Bid No Bid $9.93 $2,979.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.5. CR1 36,600 $13.00 $475,800.00 $13.24 $484,584.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.6. CR2 100 $12.00 $1,200.00 $12.01 $1,201.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.7. CR3 100 $12.00 $1,200.00 $12.01 $1,201.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.8. MS 100 No Bid No Bid $7.47 $747.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.9. QR 500 $9.00 $4,500.00 $10.79 $5,395.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.10. GQR 100 $19.00 $1,900.00 $14.81 $1,481.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.11. GQR6X9 200 $13.25 $2,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.8.12. GQR6X12 1,200 $13.25 $15,900.00 $14.69 $17,628.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.13. WR 100 $5.00 $500.00 $5.59 $559.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.14. GRB 500 $9.75 $4,875.00 $10.08 $5,040.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.15. Pugged Rock 1,000 No Bid No Bid $0.65 $650.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.16. S1.25 T1 6,000 No Bid No Bid $9.93 $59,580.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.17. S1.25 T2 4,400 No Bid No Bid $9.93 $43,692.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.18. C1.25 2,000 No Bid No Bid $13.12 $26,240.00 No Bid No Bid
4.8.19. Total $792,525.00 $1,090,975.00 $0.00

4.9.

Line Description Units by Ton Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total Unit Price/Ton Extended Total
4.9.1. SC.625 3000 $16.04 $48,120.00 No Bid No Bid
4.9.2. C .375 3000 No Bid No Bid $23.50 $70,500.00
4.9.3. C .5 3000 No Bid No Bid $23.50 $70,500.00
4.9.4. Total  No Bid $48,120.00 $141,000.00
4.12.

8% 5% 7%
8% 8% 7%
8% 10% 7%

$792,525.00 $1,139,095.00 $141,000.00
Yes No YesCooperative?
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